
 
 
 

 
CDW Canada Awarded Multi-Year Contract by Canada’s Largest Healthcare 

Procurement Services Organization: HealthPRO 
 

Etobicoke, ON — August 1, 2017 — CDW Canada, a leading provider of technology solutions for 

Canadian organizations in the public and private sectors, is delighted to announce that it has been 
awarded a contract by HealthPRO, Canada’s largest healthcare procurement services organization. 
This multi-year relationship allows CDW Canada to supply Ergotron healthcare solutions, including 
medical and clinical procedure carts, telehealth carts, point-of-care wall mount products, charging 
systems, sit-stand workstations, and more, to HealthPRO members which include, provincial health 
authorities, hospitals, and shared service organizations across the country.  
 
Founded in 1996, HealthPRO represents the purchasing interests of healthcare facilities, shared service 
organizations and provincial authorities across Canada. Through its national aggregated purchasing 
power, HealthPRO helps member shareholders maximize savings across many vastly used, high quality 
products and services, thereby contributing to the sustainability of Canada’s healthcare system.  
 
This agreement further strengthens CDW Canada and Ergotron’s ability to continue to provide 
healthcare solutions that deliver productivity gains and improve patient care to healthcare facilities 
across Canada. 

 
About CDW Canada  
CDW Canada is a leading provider of technology solutions for business, government, education and 
healthcare. Ranked the No. 1 solution provider in Canada on the Computer Dealer News Top 100 
Solution Providers list for four consecutive years, CDW Canada helps customers achieve their goals by 
delivering integrated technology solutions and services that help customers navigate an increasingly 
complex IT market and maximize the return on their technology investment. CDW Canada is listed on 
the Financial Post 500 list and is a wholly owned subsidiary of Vernon Hills, Illinois-based CDW 
Corporation, a Fortune 500 company. For more information, visit www.CDW.ca. 
 
About Ergotron 
For more than three decades, Ergotron has offered affordable ergonomic products to computer users 
bringing comfort, wellness and improved productivity into the workplace. Our history of innovation and 
passion for differentiation is evidenced in our growing portfolio of beautifully designed mounting and 
mobility products for computer monitors, notebooks, tablets and other devices, flat panel displays and 
TVs that are as easy to use as they are to mount. “Productivity. Wellness. Balance. Feel the difference.” 
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